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Vaughan Public Libraries (VPL) Unveils NovelBranch Book Vending 
Machine at Father E. Bulfon Community Centre 

VAUGHAN, ONTARIO – Vaughan Public Libraries (VPL) is excited to announce the 
NovelBranch Book Vending Machine launch at the Father E. Bulfon Community Centre, 
offering a convenient literary resource for the community ahead of the scheduled Woodbridge 
Library closure for renovations. This cutting-edge self-serve vending machine is designed to 
cater to the literary needs of the community while the Woodbridge Library undergoes 
renovations, creating anticipation for the unveiling of the new West Woodbridge Library. 

The NovelBranch will house approximately 200 books, ranging from new releases to popular 
titles in various genres, including Adult Fiction, Adult Non-fiction, Adult Italian-language 
Fiction, YA Fiction/Graphic Novels, Junior Fiction/Graphic Novels, Picturebooks, and Board 
Books. This initiative aims to seamlessly provide library services to our valued customers 
during the temporary closure of the Woodbridge Library. 

 Library customers can enjoy an interactive and convenient experience with the NovelBranch. 
By scanning their library card or entering the card number, customers can effortlessly open 
the glass door, explore the shelves, read book descriptions, and make selections. Returning 
books is just as straightforward—scan the card, open the door, and place the items on the 
shelf. Furthermore, customers can return books borrowed from other VPL locations, making 
the NovelBranch a central hub for literary exchanges within the community. 

 "We are excited to bring the NovelBranch to the Father E. Bulfon Community Centre, offering 
a unique and accessible way for our community to continue enjoying the vast literary 
resources VPL has to offer," said Margie Singleton, CEO of VPL. 

 The NovelBranch is stocked with diverse reading materials to cater to all ages and interests, 
fostering a love for reading within the community. As we eagerly anticipate the reopening of 
the Woodbridge Library and the grand opening of West Woodbridge Library, the NovelBranch 
stands as a symbol of innovation and commitment to providing exceptional library services. 
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About Vaughan Public Libraries  
Vaughan Public Libraries is a leading community-centered library system dedicated to 
educate, excite and empower the community. With over three million visitors annually and 
500,000 resources, advanced technology, and diverse programming, we offer lifelong learning 
opportunities. Our firm commitment to excellence, diversity, equity, and inclusion fosters a 
welcoming environment where all can thrive. 
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